TOWN OF LEWISBORO
Highway Department

P.O. Box 500 — 11 Main Street
South Salem, NY 10590
Tel: (914) 763-3166
Fax: (914) 763-8134

4/1/2024

The Town of Lewisboro Highway Department received, opened, and read aloud sealed bids
for the purchase of the following materials at the Town of Lewisboro Town House , 11 Main

Street, South Salem NY 10590, at 1:00 p.m. on the 26" day of March 2024. Results are
attached, the prices will remain in effect until March 31, 2025. The following vendors had
representatives in attendance: Clove Excavators Inc., Inter County Paving Co. Inc., Kect
Construction, Lawton Adams Construction Corp. & Peckham Materials.

The Town of Lewisboro reserves the right to allow all municipal and not for profit
organizations authorized under the General Municipal Laws of the State of New York, to
purchase any goods and/or services awarded as a result of this bid request in accordance with
the latest amendments to NYS GML 100 through 104. However, it is understood that the
extension of such contracts are at the discretion of the vendor, and the vendor is only bound to
any contract between the Town of Lewisboro and the vendor. Additionally, the Town reserves
the right to purchase any goods or services included as part of this bid request from any means
legally available to it at any time.

Bituminous Concrete
Bituminous Concrete Laid-in-Place
Liquid Bituminous Materials/Crushed Stone Laid-in-Place
Gravel & Stone
Sand
Catch Basins, Catch Basin Tops, & Grate Risers
Guide Rail & Post Installation
Yellow & White Pavement Marking

Thank you,

John Winter
Superintendent of Highways



TOWN OF LEWISBORO
HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025

Bid opening held March 26, 2024

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE

Laid-In-Place Per Net Ton Clove Intercounty Kect
403.118902 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 1 Base Course 114.00 121.51 114.00
403.138902 M [Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 3 Binder Course 115.50 122.51 114.00
403.159802 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 5 Shim Course 148.00 151.51 145.00
403.178902 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 6 Top Course 112.80 122.00 114.00
403.178302 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 6F3 Top Course 112.80 123.51 114.00
403.198302 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 7F3 Top Course 128.00 133.51 125.00
403.218902 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, True and Level Course 140.00 160.00 120.00
404.178902 Warm Mix Asphalt Type 6F3 Base Course 119.00 127.51 119.00
404.118902 Warm Mix Asphalt Type 1 Base Course 118.00 127.00 119.00
404.138902 Warm Mix Asphalt Type 3 Binder 119.00 128.00 119.00
402.098101 9.5mm Super Pave Top 128.00 135.00 115.00
402.128102 12.5mm Super Pave Top 112.90 123.51 113.80
402.198901 19.0mm Super Pave Top 115.00 122.51 114.00
402.258901 25.0mm Super Pave Top Binder 116.00 122.51 114.00
402.378901 37.5mm Super Pave Top Base 116.00 122.51 114.00
402.068101 6.3 Polymer Modified Top 148.00 148.51 142.00
Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Certificate X X X
Completed & Signed Laid in Place Bituminous page 6 of bid packet X X X

Clove Excavators, Inc/Poughkeepsie, NY
Intercounty Paving Company Inc./Carmel, NY
Kect Construction Corp/Patterson, NY




TOWN OF LEWISBORO
HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025
BITUMINOUS CONCRETE (BLACKTOP) FOB

Bid opening held March 26, 2024

FOB Per Net Ton Peckham Thalle
403.118902 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 1 Base Course 93.50 91.00
403.128902 M |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 3 Binder course 94.50 91.00
403.159802 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 5 Shim Course 118.00 110.00
403.178902 M |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 6 Top Course 96.00 93.00
403.178302 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, Type 6F3 Top Course 96.00 93.00
403.218902 M  |Hot Mix Asphalt, True and Level Course 116.00 101.00
714-06 Asphaltic Concrete Curb Mix 114.00 0.00
403-2001 Winter Mix 0.00 0.00 *
Optional Plant Fine Top Mix 106.00 101.00
Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Certificate X X
Completed & Signed Bituminous Concrete page 9 of bid packet X X

Peckham Materials Corp/Brewster, NY
Thalle Industries Inc/Fishkill, NY
*Winter Mix: Only one bid received/envelope not marked 'Sealed Bid' & was opened before bid*



TOWN OF LEWISBORO
HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025

Bid opening held March 26, 2024 N O B I D S

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

TABLE 702-4 - ITEM 1

Medium Curing Cutback, Per Gal Applied

TABLE 702-3 - ITEM 2

Rapid Curing Cutback, Per Gal Applied

Table 702-1 - ITEM 3

Penetration Asphalt Binder, Per Gal Applied

TABLE 702-5 & 702-6 - ITEM 4

CRS-2 Cationic Emulsion, Per Gal Applied

ITEM 5

6.3mm Polymer modified, Per Gal Applied

BITUMENS & CRUSHED STONE (Complete in Place) - 2024/2025

ITEM 6, Rapid Curing Cutback,

including 3/8” stone applied & rolled, Per Gal

ITEM 7, Penetration Asphalt Binder

including 3/8” stone applied & rolled, Per Gal

ITEM 8, CRS-2, Emulsified asphalt

including 3/8: stone applied & rolled, Per Gal

Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Certificate

Completed & Signed Bitumen & Crushed Stone page 11




TOWN OF LEWISBORO
HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025 GRAVEL & STONE
Bid opening held March 26, 2024
Delivered Per Ton

DARK GRAY
Crushed Stone Lawton Putnam Thalle Wingdale
1/4" Stone 43.00 0 39.00 0.00
3/8" Stone 42.00 0 39.00 39.95
1/2" Stone 40.00 0 39.00 36.45
3/4" Stone 36.00 0.00 34.25 34.95
1-1/2" Stone 0 0.00 34.25 34.95
2" Stone 0 0 34.25 37.50
Stone Fill
Fine Stone Fill 45.00 0 39.00 0
Light Stone Fill 45.00 0.00 39.00 0
Medium Stone Fill 62.00 0 55.00 0
Heavy Stone Fill 0 0 72.00 0
LIMESTONE
Crushed Stone Lawton Putnam Thalle Wingdale
1/4" Stone 0 0 0 0
3/8" Stone 0 0 0 0
1/2" Stone 0 0 0 0
3/4" Stone 0 34.95 0 0
1-1/2" Stone 0 34.95 0 0
2" Stone 0 0 0 0
Stone Fill
Fine Stone Fill 0 0 0 40.95
Light Stone Fill 0 38.45 0 40.95
Medium Stone Fill 0 0 55.45
Heavy Stone Fill 0 0 79.95
ITEM 4
Type 1 Sub base Course — Earth tone *32.00 27.95 27.50 28.95
Recycled Item 4 *%22.00 *4%17.95 19.50 *4%17.95
Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Cert X X X X
Completed & Signed Gravel & Stone page 14 X X X X

Lawton Adams Construction Corp/Somers, NY/*Local item #4/**Per cubic yard/Structural Screened Fill-Earth Tone $22.00 per cubic yard
Putnam Materials Corp/Brewster, NY ***Asphalt Blend

Thalle Industries, Inc/Fishkill, NY

Wingdale Materials LLC/Brewster, NY  ***4sphalt Blend



TOWN OF LEWISBORO

HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025
Bid opening held March 26, 2024

SAND
FOB Per Ton Red Wing| Thalle Wingdale
Ice Control Sand 18.00 20.00 19.00
Dry Screened 0 20.00 19.00
Delivered Per Net Ton
Ice Control Sand 30.00 33.00 32.45
Dry Screened 0 33.00 32.45
Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Certificate X X X
Completed & Signed Sand page 16 of bid packet X X X

Red Wing Properties Inc/Stormville, NY
Thalle Industries, Inc/Fishkill, NY
Wingdale Materials LLC/Brewster, NY




TOWN OF LEWISBORO

HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025

Bid opening held March 26, 2024

CATCH BASINS, CATCH BASIN TOPS, & GRATE RISERS

Chemung Expanded

Reinforced Precast 3 Foot Catch Basin 0 375.00
Reinforced Precast 4 Foot Catch Basin 0 415.00
Reinforced Precast Catch Baby Basin 0 300.00
Precast Reinforced Concrete Tops Chemung Expanded

Flat Top 45"x56"x8" with Grate and Frame 19-1/2"x36" 0 804.00

Curb Top 45"x56" 0 820.00
Steel Grate Riser Chemung Expanded

36" x 19.375 x 1.5" rise -- 3" thick 275.00 260.00
Steel Grate Riser Chemung Expanded

20 1/8 x 19 5/8 x 2 5/8 inside frame 275.00 0

19 % x 19/ 2 x 2 5/8 thick outside grate 1.5" rise
Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Certificate X X
Completed & Signed Catch Basins, Catch Basin Tops & Grate Risers pg. X X

Chemung Supply Corporation/Elmira, NY
Expanded Supply Product/Cold Spring, NY




TOWN OF LEWISBORO
HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025
GUIDE RAIL AND POST INSTALLATION SPECIFICATIONS
Bid opening held March 26, 2024
Guide Rail and Post Installation Meeting Galvanized Specifications

CHEMUNG
1. Complete layout and installation of guide rail and posts per New York state specifications -- PER LINEAL FOOT INSTALL
12'6" w-beam 11.95
6'3" w-beam 12.85
Box Beam 13.60
2. Corrugated beam type guide rail--punched 6'3" -- PER LINEAL FOOT 16.20
3. Corrugated beam type guide rail--punched 6'3"
curved to 50" radius and up -- EACH 380.00
curved 40 to 50' radius -- EACH 380.00
curved 30 to 39' radius -- EACH 380.00
curved 20 to 29' radius -- EACH 380.00

4. Corrugated beam type guide rail---length 13'6.5" (shop curved rail)(approach and terminal) (rotation 90 degrees) -- EACH 405.00

5. 3" x 2 3/8" I-intermediate guide rail posts--length 5'3" -- EACH 92.60

6. Flared type terminal sections, 12 gauge -- EACH 52.00



10

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

Wrap around type terminal sections, 12 gauge -- EACH

Concrete anchor unit with all necessary hardware -- EACH

Galvanized splice bolts 1 1/4" x 5/8" -- EACH

Galvanized post bolts 5/16" x 1 3/4" with washer and nuts -- EACH

Galvanized post bolts 2' x 5/8" -- EACH

Galvanized support bolts 1/2" x 1 1/2", 2 nuts, no washers -- EACH

6" x 6" x 24' box beam type guide rail, including shelf angle, splice plates, nuts, and bolts -- PER LINEAL FOOT

6" X 6" box beam type guide rail curved to special radius -- PER LINEAL FOOT

6" X 6" box beam type guide rail, shop cuts, and mitered curved rail -- PER LINEAL FOOT

6" x 6" box beam guide rail end sections -- EACH

3" I-beam guide rail posts 5' 3" long, intermediate type post for box beam rail -- EACH

3" I-beam guide rail posts 3' 8" long end type post for box beam rail -- EACH

82.00

762.00

1.60

1.60

1.60

1.60

48.45

55.10

79.05

824.00

89.15

92.05



Corrugated Box Beam and Guide Rail Materials Meeting Mavari Specifications

19. Mayari corrugated beam type guide rail punched 6'3" -- PER LINEAL FOOT NO BID

20. Mayari corrugated beam type guide tail punched 6'3", curved to special radius:

curved to 50' radius and up -- EACH NO BID
curved 40 to 50 ' radius -- EACH NO BID
curved 30 to 40 ' radius -- EACH NO BID
curved 20 to 29' radius -- EACH NO BID

21. Mayari corrugated beam type guide rail -- length 13' 6 1/2" (shop curved rail) (approach and terminal) (rotation to 90 degree) -- EACH

NO BID
22. 3" x23/8" Mayari l-intermediate guide rail posts -- length 5' 3" -- EACH NO BID
23.  Mayari flared type terminal sections, 12 gauge -- EACH NO BID
24.  Mayari wrap around type terminal sections, 12 gauge -- EACH NO BID

25. 6" x 6" x 24' Mayari box beam type guide rail, including shelf angle, splice plates, nuts, & bolts-- EACH NO BID



26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

6" x 6" Mayari box beam type guide rail curved to special radius -- PER LINEAL FOOT

6" x 6" Mayari box beam type guide rail , shop cuts, and mitered curved rail -- PER LINEAL FOOT

6" x 6" Mayari box beam guide rail end sections -- EACH

3" Mayari [-beam guide rail posts 5' 3" long, intermediate type posts for box beam guide rail -- EACH

3" Mayari I-beam guide rail posts 3' 8" long end type posts for box beam guide rail -- EACH

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



1)

2)

3)

4)

TOWN OF LEWISBORO

HIGHWAY BID 2024/2025
Timber Guide Rail For Roadside Projects and Maintenance

Ironwood guide rail, price per L.F. complete
A) 1'-100'L.F.

B) 100' L.F. and over
End terminal, type 1 timber rail complete -- EACH
End terminal, type 11'timber rail complete -- EACH

Anchorage unit for ironwood guide rail, back slope -- EACH

Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Certificate
Completed & Signed Guide Rail & Post Installation page 22 of bid packet

Chemung Supply Corporation/Elmira, NY



TOWN OF LEWISBORO

HIGHWAY BID RESULTS 2024/2025
Bid opening held March 26, 2024

Pavement Marking

Unit Price Per Mile, Single Center Line

Unit Price Per Mile, Double Center Line

Unit Price Per Mile, Single White Edge Line

4 inch Wide Stop Lines, Per Stop Line

Cross Walks, per cross walk

Signed/notarized Non Collusion Bid Cert |

Completed & Signed Yellow & White Pavement Markings pg. 24




	Opening Letter
	Bituminous Concrete
	Blacktop-FOB (2)
	Oil & Stone-Liquid Bit.
	Gravel-Stone
	SAND
	Catch Basins
	Guide Rail
	Pavement Markings 

